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ALTERNATIVE WAYS OF EDUCATING TEACHERS TO EDUCATE 
CHILDREN DIFFERENTLY: WHAT DO CURRICULUM, ASSESSMENT 

AND PEDAGOGY LOOK LIKE WHEN ‘DONE DIFFERENTLY’?

BERA Member	        £30.00

Non Member		         £60.00

DELEGATE FEES

This conference looks to bring together 
teachers, educators, academics and 
other practitioners – especially those 
who lead or see themselves as having a 
remit to lead in some way, even if not as 
a manager - into a space of child-led and 
alternative education.

In this space ideas, philosophies and 
principles for putting children first are 
privileged. Leaders in and of or for 
school education – at every level of the 
teaching career ladder - are invited to 
join the BERA Alternative Education SIG, 
the BERA Educational Leadership SIG 
and the BERA Curriculum, Assessment 
and Pedagogy SIG for a day conference 
of presentations, interactive workshop 

sessions, networking and professional 
support. The day as a whole is to 
build bridges, develop professional 
knowledge and thus practice around 
putting the child first in a range of 
education contexts. 

The day ultimately is to give leaders 
in school education ways to embed 
leading for the child into their schools 
and tools to deal with any agenda which 
marginalises children and their voice in 
teaching and learning.

Keynote speakers include Prof Rachel
Lofthouse (Leeds Beckett University) and
Gopal Krishnamurthy (Head, Brockwood
Park School).
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